FILED
PFRICE OF THE 1T v gLEs,
HD

DAKL A APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY

?ﬁl&ggu‘{:é‘o BY céu%ct IﬁEMBER - %/ W@"\

City A'I'I'ORNEY

OAKLAND CITY COUNCIL
ORDINANCE NO.

H

=e- 13 5—7—6 = C.M.S.

AN ORDINANCE (1) REPEALING THE OAKLAND AMENDMENTS
TO THE 2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE, (2) ADOPTING LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO
THE 2019 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE, AND (3) AMENDING OAKLAND
MUNICIPAL CODE CHAPTER 15.04 TO COMPLY WITH
CHANGES TO STATE LAW AND ADOPTING CEQA EXEMPTION
FINDINGS

WHEREAS, the State of California‘adopts a new California Building Standards
Code every three years that goes into effect throughout the State 180 days after
publication. The California Building Standards Code is contained in Titled 24 of the
California Code of Regulations (“Title 24” hereafter), and consists of several parts that
are based upon model codes with amendments made by various State agencies; and

WHEREAS, the following editions of the California Building Standards Code are
the most current in publication:

California Administrative Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 1;
California Building Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 2;
California Residential Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 2.5;
California Electrical Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 3;
California Mechanical Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 4;

- California Plumbing Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 5;
California Energy Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 6; ‘
California Historical Building Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 8;
California Existing Building Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, part 10;
California Green Building Standards Code, 2019 Edition, Title 24, Part 11.

The 2019 Edition of the California Building Standards Code will go into effect throughout
California on January 1, 2020; and



$ " @u "

; #
) 2% 2 # ! ) %
% )" " Y% 2 1 # #% # %3
$ ) % A % 2
2 " "
# R # #1 1 "1 42 1
1 1 1 1 21 " " %1 2 1
£ 7 1 2 1 @ % 2
) # " "2y #l 2 1 1 #% $ 1
’ ' ") "2 # )y #01 .
%2 @2 ! )" % A 3
$ % 1 1 %
A < # 2 2 +(&:
to# -+H& A 2 2 /0 %
! 2 2 +(&6 "oy
-+(&6 A 2 2 /03
$ " % A " W% 2
$ " 2
$ 1 " #H 1
I 1 | 1 3
$ ) % A " % 2
2 3 B2 $ 2 2 5
t#H 1 | $ 41
21 1 % %
$ # 2 2" #" 21 %l ")
I 3
$ o ; C % &D68"81
2 2% 2 $ B 2 $ 2 2
2 Lo $ # 2
! ") >" 0h&1+(&61 $ > v o
&1+(+(3
$ n ; C % 1
22 ) W ) $
2 " n # 3
$ ) % A " W% 2
B2 $ 22 - ,






7 "1
%
" %
% " ) A
2
1 %
2 ")? 2 1
! 2 *
&8*(,*&*&+8B 2 $
"# $
- 0 @" 2
1 2
* @"
2 )%
! @" 2
$ )% "#
$ " 1
'$ 1 ) #
22 o
1 " @"
% 2 $
F " " ! @
2 )
?II n
2 $ 2 *
@" 2 $
&* ) 2
1
+* ) 2
-01 -0
g* ) 2
1
# ! % 2
¥ ) 2
1% 2
) $ 1 2 1
8* # "

#*

2

% 2
A )% , # <
# ) ;
1
% 2 < #
2
1 1 2
1 % $ %
@" 2 $
1 # "#
F n
# | 2 %
! %B -+&0
2 "#
!
) $ )% % |
! " 02
I'$ #
| #
2 2
#' #
-0 3
#' #
! n
2 " n
#' #
1
3
2 #

*

#
%

2A

$ %
$ %
<2
$
#
1
2 )%
B 2 $
)% 1
! #
)
)
2
1 3
# n
&8*("*9'(
$ -DO
# *
$
n < n
2 4
%
" H 3
-0
)II
3
"4
2 n






9*

8*

A # ?ll

*

&8*(,*&*&9(BM  *

" ' n
1

1 @ 1"1

%

|*

%
"1
"%
%

% )
" _&’O % $
2% ) ) )%
) !
x %
= "%
) 2 ) %
I $ "
) 1% $ 2
) .
oA ¢ 2 1 2%
# o # # %
, # !
2 # )
,# L 1
) * 2 $
&(6,*: %
$ 2 2%
1 21 1 2 %l
1 1 2%1 2 %1 %
% )n # "1 "2) #1
@" 2 o
% $
$ % 11 $ ) )
% L " )%
$1 2% 1 # 1 $" 1
1 )2 "
) )
) $ )% #
) 2 1 $
% 2
yUH % % A1






( w2 * 21 # " )
$ @" ! )% " :
7§ $! 2%) @ )% ! #*
$1 2% ) @ )% " # # % 2
? @" # 2 ) #02  #% |
! @" $1 Y # #
2 % )% %> $ ! ) 2
> 2 % " # * 0 $ !
@ 1 ) ! s
£ * 2 " ) # % LA T
5 ) 2 1 ) * " | )
# % LA 21 " 2 " L)
@ * 2 " ) ) N #2 7 N
$ %o # v y
% " # ) " " "o
! o TR AL $ $
% "#$ " " # 2A %
2 2 e % ! 3 % %
# " "1o# 1 1 " 01
" $ 2) ) ) "%
" @ %" # 2 LA 2 @" *
T ) ) % #L $ M2 #L 1 #
2 %o " 7 2%) @"
2 " 2 % " 2 !
F " $ % A T #
2A % 2 2 2% "
" $ 21 % )
2 2
FFo$% 2 " ) 2 $ A " )%
" 2 22 ! &( % "1 A
" )% " 2 " )
&( % 2 A 22 * OA ! $
27 1 " &8*(*+*+,(1 $
$ ! &( % ) 2 " )
) )2 ) 2 ! s
72 < D+H( % 2 " "
S I . ) oot
# I o#1 2 < 21 2 &(
% * < @" ) I # " ) !
2 *
&8*(,*&*&,( B 2 ")2 *
* @ * O "H 2 1 #21 1
"1 2" 1 1 $ %1






Fe " 2 " ) # % 1A
X 2 ) 1 ) * ) #
)% FA " 21 " 2 " ) @"
A 2" ) ) N #2
7 N $ % " # $ )%
"# ) " E "o "
2 " I AL $ $ % "# $ "
" # 2A % 2
2 @ % ! $ % % A # "
"1o# 1 1 "x O 1 " $
2) ) ) "% @ %
2 1A 2 @" * " )
) Y o #1L $ M2 #1 | # 2 %o
F - $ % ) s " # 2 A
% 2 2 2% " " $
&8*(,*&*&,8 B # # # ")2 "
¥ = x 7 ")2 "2 ! ")2 ! 2
) " * % @" 2
% 11 ! #$ *
¥ * 7 ")2 "2 @" ) )%
# # ) # )% ! <
NI' N # )% * 21 1 2 "2)
) % < * <
")2 ) NI'N # ! % #
L 21 % "
@" 1 " % #
% ! 1A !
) ) ! *
o H # 7 * 7 ")2 " )%
# # -1 3 #1 " # 1
2 # 1 # 1 1 *0 ) #
)% ! < N!' N # )%
* 21 1 2 "2)
% < * <
")2 ) NI'N # ! % #
L 21 ¢ ) %
% " 2 )" #01
-0 < ) % ! # "
)$* $ %1 # 2%
" )% !






2 %3 )" % *MI 2 % ! $3 !
! $ 1% 3 " 1% # $3
# $ pr3 ! P! %3 1%
$"3 | S $" # $"3 # $ "
2 % A %*
E* < * ! &
| # "2) | #
"2 "2 %
* B7 * )%
1) ) )% ! $ # $
2 # A *
* A " # " * A " # "
2 " 1
#" - 01 +17 +-" #01 7 +*8 - 01
7 9 - oL 7 , - 01 7 8-7"2) #01 7 D= #%01 7
"o "#01 7 & -< # " #01 7 && -= "#
01 7 &+ - 0 2 2
)% " % A *
* % ) * 7"2) #
* -2 0 -0 0 1 @ )%
" Cc7 889:*& 889:*+1! # %
A % "2 "2
")2 [ 2 * 2 $ - 20
) ! " c7
889:*& &1 &9: #
M* # * # -0 $ ) NI'N #
- 0 2# " # #
# "2 2 * N! # *N
o* "$% ) #* ! $ % )%
2 )" % # "$% !
$ " 7 1 P "$ %
™ NON # * -0 Q # ! # % A
% "2 "2 "2
! 2 * N # *N
&8*(,;*&*&'( B7! " ) # *
* " # " $
* F " "1 " # $ !
2 * "H# $ !
" #"
"2 2% ) 2 % %






F.  The Building Official may request, and shall receive the assistance and cooperation
of other officials of this jurisdiction so far as is required in the dlscharge of the duties
required by this Code or other pertinent law or ordinance.

G. Pursuant to Oakland Municipal Code section 1.28.010, violations of the provisions
' of this Code shall be a misdemeanor. The penalty for conviction shall be punishable

by the maximum fines and sentence of |mpr|sonment in the County Ja|I prescrlbed by
law.

A certified copy of each judgment imposing fine or cost or both upon any owner of any
real property for a violation of this Code pertaining to the building, structure, portion
thereof, or the real property shall, upon the entry of judgment,-be filed forthwith with the
Alameda County Clerk-Recorder.

Article Il
Part 1 - Administrative Amendments to the California Administrative Code

15.04.2.100 - Reserved.

Article Il
Part 2 - Administrative Amendments to the California Building Code

15.04.2.200 - Refer to Article 1.
Refer to Article | - General Administrative Amendments of this Chapter.

15.04.2.201 - Section 101.2 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.

In Section 101.2 of Chapter 1 of the Callfornla Buﬂdlng Code, and add Section
15.04.1.110 of this Chapter.

15.04.2.202 - Section 102.1 of CBC Chapter 1 amended
In Section 102.1 of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, replace this Section in
its entirety with section 15.04.1. 115 of this Chapter.

15.04.2.203 - Section 102.2 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.
In Section 102.2 of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, replace this Section in
its entirety with section 15.04.1.120 of this Chapter.

15.04.2.205 - Section 103 of CBC Chapter 1 deleted.

In Section 103 of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, delete this Sectlon in its
entirety.

15.04.2.207 - Section 104 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.
In Section 104 of Chapter 1 of the California Bundlng Code, add section 15.04.1.130
of this Chapter as a new subsection 104.13.

15.04.2.209 - Section 105.1 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.






&8*(,*+*+&+ B &(8*9 &2 *
&(8*9 & "# 1
&8*(,*&*&,( "2) 6") # *
&8*(,*+*+&9 B &(8*9*& &2 *
&(8*9*& & "# 1
% | | #4
NO "# I A )
2 1 1 !
@" 2 |
2 ) 2 $
@ # 2 $ 1AL
2 F " #
$ ) 1 "# " 2
&8*(,*+*+&, B &(8*9*+ &2 %
&(8*9*+ & "# 1
N*** 2 < 2 < 6(
N < 2 < # & %N*
&8*(*+*+&: B &(8*8 & 2 *
&(8*8 & "# 1
% | &8*(,*&*&88 *
&8*(,*+*+&DB &(8*: & 2 %
&(8*: & "# 1
% ! &8*(*&*&:( *
&8*(*+*+&' B &(8*D &2 *
&(8*D & "# 1
% | | #4
N > # 2
" 0 @ # % $ $ )1
1 | # 2 - ) 04
&* $ 1 t#
# *
+* $" *
o+ P " $ $ 1 721
* 2 2% ) @" )%
21 AL 11 # #1  *0*
8 % "2 2% ) % 2
) 1 @" 2
%2 " 1 *O0*N
&8*(,*+*+&6 B &(8* &
| &(8* R #4

% N !

# $11 *0*
A -<$ 1



"Section 105.8 Responsibility of Permittee Building permits shall be
presumed to incorporate the provision that the applicant, the applicant's agent,
employees or contractors shall carry out the proposed work in accordance with the
approved plans and with all requirements of this code and any other laws or
regulations applicable thereto, whether specified or not. No approval shall relieve or
exonerate any person from the responsibility of complying with the provisions and
intent of this code."

15.04.2.220 - Section 107.1 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.
In Section 107.1 of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, add section
15.04.1.145 as a new subsection 107.1.1.

15.04.2.221 - Section 107.1 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.
In Section 107.1 of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, add section
15.04.1.150 as a new subsection 107.1.2.

15.04.2.222 - Section 107.1 of CBC Chapter 1 amended.

In Section 107.1 of the California Building Code, replace the phrase "... two or more
sets. . ." in the first sentence with "three or more sets, as the Building Official may
require ...".

15.04.2.223 - Section 107.2.5 of CBC Chapter 1 amended. _
In Section 107.2.5 of the California Building Code, replace this Section in its entirety
with the following:

Section 107.2.5 Site Plan
Section 107.2.5.1 Boundary And Topographic Survey Maps
Section 107.2.5.1.1 Required Submittal
A combined map or separate maps of a boundary survey, including easement

locations, and a topographic survey shall be submitted with all applications for a
building permit for a new structure and as otherwise required by the Building

. Official. One (1) electronic copy in an approved format and two (2) non-electronic
copies of the map or maps shall be submitted on approved media (compact disk,
heavy bond paper, etc.) which shall bear the seal and wet signature of the Surveyor
In Responsible Charge. The surveys shall have been performed (or re-certified) not
more than three (3) years prior to the date of the permit application. The surveys
shall be drawn to a scale of not less than 1 inch equals 10 feet. The boundary
survey shall be retraceable independent of the monuments or other markers that
have been set during the survey.

Section 107.2.5.1.2 Required Information
The following information shall be included on the map or maps:

1. The boundary lines of the subject property with their courses and lengths.

EXCEPTION

Where approved by the Building Official for large sites, the extent of the survey
may be limited to a minimum of 65 feet from the exterior wall of the proposed _
building, provided a vicinity map is shown indicating the location of the survey as it
relates to the site as a whole. .



+* 1 )%l 2 2" *

! 2 "2 < !
"$ % ) # 2% ) @ 2
2 "2 2 # % " % )" %
) *
9* "$% 2 ! )" %
$ ) % AN "$% ) 2
! 7 &+9,1  >"  &1&68(1 **NO*
* # 2 ! ) # )" %
$ ) $  -*uN ) # 2 ) "
2 "2 2 1 A 8V O I weNO*
g* % 2" 2 A )%
"$ % ) B $ )$ L%
A "2 7 A "21 ) * )" % "$% 2
" $ ! !
# "$% 2* " % "$% 2 $ " $
% " $ )$ )l % A
"2 7 A "21 )* O 7 A "2
"1 # $ % A "2 ) $ *
* # ") # B B! % 2 %
# *
D* 2 #
< # % *
' " < # g " $ ! $ #
2 $ 80 * % ) % A
"2 7 A "21 ) *
T7
o) $ % " # 1%
#" NN $ 0 2%) $ " " !
$% $  # %
o) 7 A 21 # $ %
A "2 ) $
6 = " < 2 $
" # B Bl % "2 $
2 2"2 &0 )% % *
&(* < # ) # "o - #
11 )1 *0 0%*
88 < # " $ non 2 $2 1
" ")l A1l $2 1 |1 "1 1%l

"$ 1 # % % 2 @"



12.

13.

14.

15.
16.

17.
18.

19.

‘The location, nature, and record information, of all public end private easements
of record located on or directly affecting the site.

The location and width of existing driveways, referenced to any existing
driveways within fifty (50) feet, with an indication of the percentage gradient of
the existing driveway. - _ :

The location of traffic signal poles, street lighting standards, fire hydrants,
sidewalk boxes, street trees, signs, pull boxes, parking meters or parking pay
stations, utility poles, City Monuments and/or benchmarks, and any other utilities
or fixed objects within fifty (50) feet of a proposed driveway that may interfere
with access to the property.

The location at the approximate center of the base and the diameter at breast
height of 'all protected trees as required by Chapter 12.36 of the Oakland

‘Municipal Code.

A North arrow, the date that the field survey was performed, the area of the
site, the scale of the plat, and a title block which includes the legal description of
the site (i.e.: "Lot 2 of Parcel Map 1234, recorded June 1, 1950, ...").

Existing horizontal or vertical curves within three hundred (300) feet of a
proposed driveway. '

The location of existing crosswalks and bus stops within one hundred (100) feet
of a proposed driveway. ,

Any additional information necessary to obtain compliance with this Code or
related State laws and local ordinances as determined by the Building Official,
including, but not limited to:

a. boundary closure and area calculations (2 copies, sealed and signed by the
surveyor); and

~b. evidence of compliance W|th State laws relating to mandatory f|I|ng of Corner

20.

Record(s) or a Record of Survey.

A statement signed by the Surveyor In Responsible Charge for the boundary
survey map and/or topographic survey map as follows:

a. For use when the boundary survey (and/ or easement determination) and
topographic survey are performed by, or under the responsible charge of, the
same surveyor

BOUNDARY AND TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY STATEMENT

This map correctly represents a survey made by me or under my direction
in conformance with the requirements of the California Land Surveyors' Act at
the request of __[insert owner or agent's name] _ , on _[date]

| hereby state that all existing grades and contours are based upon City of
Oakland/Port of Oakland ( select one ) datum.




% ) 206A | # $
) ! $ ) " % *
W% 0 # )% 2% " $ % !
2 -0 2 ! -
0
J - 0 -01 w \W # 2 4
* **1 * * 2 " % 1
: @" | 2 2 " % 7 "4
W 17& °
J 4 w2 2 W A
W # X 2 " % *
J 7 Os$ 1 W W # 2 4 1
**1 * 2 n % *
% " ! P "$% L
2 "$ %
@" "$% )
] @ ) !
! 2 2 ) )% P )% " %
"$ % ! $ % % "$% L *
J @" "$% ) ' 2 "% "$% 1
! 2 2 2 ) )% I
1 ! ! #1 # % "$ %
" "$% )2 % A1l ! 2 %
")2 % "$% %*
W% Al # "$ % ) 2% )
$ ) )" # N
# " F(
-% 20
7*P** - 7* *O * UU< *+(
¥oOFE " )t % "$% - Q 2 2 0
2 o1 ) 41 "$% |
) u "$ %4
M
2 % )% "$% 2 )%2 " 2%
2 ! @" 2 P
"$% L @" W ! # L 2

W X








































































planting, paved ditches, planted swales, benches, storm drains, dissipation
structures, rip rap, and storm water retention basins.

A narrative description shall also be provided of measures to be taken,
specifications for planting materials, fertilizers, planting and malntenance
procedures.

An estimate of the length of time which will be required for the planting to
produce a permanent coverage which will be sufficient to provide the degree of
erosion control protection for which it is designed.

. Section 1802B.8 Permit Appllcat|on Initial Statement(s) of the ClVll Engineer(s) in
Responsible Charge.

1. One Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge.

~ Where one Civil Engineer will be in responsible charge of the entire gradihg
project, including, but not limited to the preparation of the grading plans, the
exact following Initial Statement of the Engineer is required:

DATE
* Building Official
City of Oakland
Dalziel Administration Building
250 Frank Ogawa Plaza
Oakland, CA 94612
RE: Grading at (Same address as on application) -
INITIAL STATEMENT OF THE ENGINEER

| have been retained by (Applicant) to be in responsible
charge of the grading work at. property referenced above. | will assume full
responsibility, as responsibility is defined in Section 15.04.3.2340 of the
Oakland Municipal Code, for carrying out the followmg to the best of my
knowledge and ability:

a. Assuring that testing and inspection required for the work in
progress and the completed work shall be accomplished ina timely and
professional manner to determine whether all the work is being/was
done in accordance with plans, schedule and specifications approved
by the Building Official.

b. Notifying the Applicant, verbally and in writing (with a copy to the
Building Official), of any work not being performed in accordance with
the approved plans, schedule and specifications.

~ ¢. Notifying the Applicant, verbally and in writing (with a copy to the
Building Official), of any work not meeting the requirements of the
approved plans and specifications.






Where more than one Civil Engineer shall function as Civil Engineer in
Responsible Charge and divide their responsibilities, each will submit in the
exact text, the following Initial Statement of the Engineer:

- DATE
Building Official
City of Oakland
‘Dalziel Administration Building
250 Frank Ogawa Plaza
Oakland, CA 94612
RE: Grading at (Same address as on application)

INITIAL STATEMENT OF THE ENGINEER (DIVIDED
RESPONSIBILITY)" -

| have been retained by ;(Applicant) to be in responsible
charge of the portions of grading work enumerated below. | will assume full
responsibility for carrying out the following to the best of my knowledge and
ability (Each individual engineer shall enumerate and prowde the portions of
work he is to be responsible for).

If my services on the job are terminated, | will, at said time of
termination, submit to the Building Official a Statement of Partial
Completion addressing the progress and conditions of all of the applicable
items above and attach thereto the results of such inspections and tests
which have been completed. :

Signed:

(Registered Civil Engineer)
License No. ‘ ; Expiration

4. When those Civil Engineers in Responsible Charge, as specified in ltem 3 above,
are not the Civil Engineers who prepared the approved plan, each Civil Engineer
in Responsible Charge shall add the paragraph shown in ltem 2 above.

5. No Initial Statement(s) of the Engineer shall be accepted as complete until all
responsibilities addressed in Item 1 above have been covered by one or more
Civil Englneer(s) in Responsible Charge.

Section 1802B.9 Permlt Appllcatlon Initial Statement(s) of the Civil Englneer(s) in
Responsible Charge—ResponS|b|I|t|es Deflned

The responsibilities of the Civil Engineer(s) in Responsible Charge defined for purposes
of this Article are defined as follows:

1. Ihspection and Testing.



The Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge shall inspect the work in
progress and perform such tests as may be necessary during the progress of
the work to determine whether all grading work is done in accordance with the
Plans and Specifications approved by the Building Official. The Building Official
or his authorized representative may conduct unscheduled inspections of
grading work in progress to assess whether such work poses a hazard to I|fe
and public or private property.

2. Substandard Performance; Notification of Applicant.

When the inspection and testing reveals that the work is not being properly
performed, and/or all or any portion of the work does not meet with the
requirements of the approved Plans, Schedule and Specifications, the Civil
Engineer in Responsible Charge shall immediately notify the Applicant, verbally
and. in writing (with a copy to the Building Official). The Civil Engineer in
Responsible Charge shall also notify the Applicant of any modifications which .
are required in his performance and the necessary corrective measures to be
taken to cure the deficiencies in.the work.

3.  Changes in the Approved Plans, Schedule and'Specifications' Due to
Unforeseen Conditions.

If, during the progress of the grading work, the Civil Engineer in
Responsible Charge finds it necessary to require significant changes due to
unforeseen conditions, he/she shall submit (through the Applicant), amended
Plans, Schedule and Specifications for the approval of the Building Official.
He/she shall also submit, at that time, a report setting forth the reason for the
changes. The report shall also include any recommended changes to future

- improvement plans necessitated by the amended plan. The Civil Engineer in
Responsible Charge shall also notify, verbally and in writing (with a copy to the
Building Official), the Applicant of any portion of the grading work affected by
the amended plans and recommend whether or not work should proceed before
the amended plans are approved by the Building Official.

4. - Upon completion of the grading work, the Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge
shall submit in a timely manner a Statement of Completion. He or she shall, at
that time, also state in writing that interim erosion and sedimentation control
measures, where required by the Building Official, have been taken and appear
to be adequate until permanent erosion control planting is effectively established.

5. It shall not be the responsibility of the Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge to
perform the direction or supervision of the personnel and equipment performing
the actual grading work unless they are in the employ of the CIVI| Engineer in
Responsible Charge '

6. It shall not be the responsibility of the Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge to
supervise, direct, inspect, or test any improvements being constructed
coincidentally with the grading work but not a part of the approved grading plan.

Section 1802B.10 Permit Application—Proposed Work Schedule.



Statement of Completion in his/her areas of responsibility with respect to the Grading
Permit in writing. The grading work under any permit shall not be considered complete
until each of the following items have been addressed by the Civil Engineer in
Responsible Charge, who shall file with Building Official a written statement stating that
said items have been completed and/or are true to the best of his/her knowledge and

belief:

1.

Her/his/their appropriate portion of grading work has been done in accordance
with the plans and amended plans prepared or adjusted by her/him and approved
by the Building Official. All modifications made by the -Civil Engineer in
Responsible Charge shall be specifically set forth in the Statement of Completion.

‘In the Civil Engineer's opinion, the finish graded slopes in the subject area are
in a stable condition.

Where required by the Building Official, interim and/or permanent erosion and

sedimentation control measures have been taken, and that where interim
measures have been taken, they will adequately control erosion and
sedimentation if properly maintained, until permanent erosion control planting is
effectively established.

The magnitude of the total settlements and differential settlements which are
likely to occur, the allowable loads of bearing pressures which may be imposed,
and stating that compaction is adequate for the uses proposed for the property
and adequate to develop the recommended bearing pressures.

Any limitations which should be imposed on the development of the property
because of soil conditions and amendments to the approved grading plan.

The Civil Engineer(s) in Responsible Charge shall also submit with the above
items, all documentation necessary to support her/his/ their Statement(s) of
Compiletion (i.e., records of inspections, tests, observations, etc.).

Section 1805B.2 Statement of Completion of Civil Engineer(s) in Responsible Charge
Partial Completion.

When, in the estimation of the Building Official, an entire grading project cannot be
completed before phased construction may proceed on structural foundations or
retaining structures in order to provide for the public and private welfare, safety and
convenience, the Building Official may require the Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge
to submit a partial written statement addressing the satisfactory completion of those
items. Separate building permits shall be required for the necessary structures. The
total grading work shall be addressed in Statement of Completlon prior to final
inspection of any structures.

Section 1805B.3 Statement of Completion of Civil Englneer(s) in Responsible Charge-
Responsibility Changes Hands.



In all grading operations, if one Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge's services are
terminated and another Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge assumes the
responsibility for the remainder of the work, each Civil Engineer shall immediately file
the Statement of Completion with respect to the portion of the work for which she/he is
responsible and stating what work was completed and what work was improperly or -
inadequately done at the time of the termination of her/his responsibility. No grading
work shall proceed unless the Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge takes the
responsibilities, and the Building Official shall suspend any permit when the grading
work is not under the responsibility of a Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge approved
by the City. ' _

Section 1805B.4 Statement df Completion of Civil Engineer(s) in Responsible Charge-
Grounds for Denial of Building Permit.

When a Grading Permit is issued on a site, the Building Official shall be notified that no
Building Permit for the construction or repair of any structure on the property shall be
issued until Statement(s) of Completion covering the completed grading work has/have
been filed, unless the issuance of a Building Permit is required to allow construction of
retaining walls or other structures designed in accordance with the Oakland Building
Construction Code in order to allow completion of the grading work, in which case a
cash bond may be required to guarantee the filing of Statement(s) of Completion
covering the completed grading work. ‘

Section 1805B.5 Statement of Completion of the Civil Engineer(s) in Responsible
Charge-Related to Final Inspection and Certification of Occupancy.

No Final Inspection, as required by the Oakland Building Construction Code, shall be
made and no Temporary Certificate of Occupancy or Certification of Occupancy shall be
issued by the Building Official for any structures located on a site for which a Grading
Permit has been issued prior to the acceptance by the Building Official of the Statement
of Completion of the Civil Engineer in Responsible Charge. The Building Official may
reject a Statement of Completion which, in her/his judgment, does not adequately meet
the requirements of this Chapter.

Section 1806B Responsibility for Performance of Grading Work.

The Permittee shall bear full responsibility for the performance and maintenance of the
work in accordance with the approved Plans, Schedule, Conditions and Specifications
and any approved modifications thereof, and also shall bear full responsibility for

- accomplishing the work in accordance with the recommendations of the Civil Engineer
in Responsible Charge during the progress of the work. The Permittee shall be present
at all times work is in progress and shall be completely responsible for the supervision
and direction of all personnel and equipment performing work under the Grading Permit.






The following shall apply to all grading work:

1.

10.

11.

12,

Grading, erosion control and sedlmentatlon control work shall be done in
accordance with plans hereinbefore described.

No grading work shall be done during the wet season except for emergency
stabilization of geotechnical instability.

Temporary erosion and sedimentation control facilities shall be completely in
place prior to October 15th and shall be diligently maintained to ensure
effectiveness through April 15th.

The hours of grading operations shall be only between 7:00 a.m. to 9:00 p.m.
weekdays, 8:30 a.m. to 6:00 p.m. Saturdays, and prohibited on Sundays and
Holidays unless otherwise approved by the Building Official. Exceptions will only
be granted if it can be shown that there is a compelling public interest to grade
during prohibited times.

No clearing and grubbing shall take place on any site for which a Grading Permit
is required prior to the issuance of a valid Grading Permit.

Where required, a valid Tree Removal Permit must be obtained pribr to the
issuance of a Grading Permit. No tree removal shall take place until both Tree
Removal Permit and a Grading Permit, if required, has been issued.

No grading shall be approved on properties adjacent to the site without the
written permission of the adjacent property owner. Such written permission shall
be notarized and acknowledged and presented to the Building Official as a part
of the items required with the application for,a Grading Permit.

The rate of slope of the surface of permanent fills shall not be steeper than 2 to
1 and the rate of permanent cut slopes shall not be steeper than 1.5 to 1, unless

otherwise recommended in the Soils Report and approved by the Building

Official. v \ ) v
Areas to receive fill shall be adequately prepared by stripping unsuitable material
and by benching slopes. Where past sliding is known or suspected or where
unstable material exists, all such unstable material shall be stripped, with slip

surfaces destroyed by benching and subdrainage installed before the fill is
placed.

Drainage facilities shall be provided to convey stormwater to a natural
watercourse, swale or other drainage way, or to a public storm drainage system
at locations and in a manner satisfactory to the City Engineer or Building Official.
Adequate temporary measures shall be taken to control stormwater during
grading operations.

Erosion control shall include planting of all graded areas to be left exposed to
the elements in accordance with the planned maintenance of such areas.

No grading shall be done which will cause sloughing of materials from or onto
adjoining property.



' Section' 1811B.1 Security—Grading Performance.

A performance security shall be required for every grading permit issued under this
Chapter. A minimum of one thousand dollars ($1,000) or two percent (2%) of the Civil
Engineer's estimate of cost of grading work, whichever is greater, shall be provided in
cash or cashier's check. The total amount of the security shall be determined by the
Building Official after consideration of the estimated cost of the work, the possible
consequences of non-completion, particularly with respect to adjacent properties, public
safety and any other relevant factors. The minimum security required shall be one
hundred percent (100%) of the engineer's estimate of cost of grading work. The form of
the security shall be cash, cashier's check, approved surety bond (for an indefinite
duration), irrevocable letter of credit, or other liquid financial instrument approved by the
Building Official.

The security shall remain in full force and effect until the Statement of Completion has
been accepted by the Building Official. The security shall obligate the principal, his or
her executors, administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and severally, with the
surety, and shall inure to the benefit of the City and to any person aggrieved by the
principal's (owner/applicant's) failure to comply with the conditions thereof.

The security shall be conditioned on the faithful performance of the work under the
Grading Permit and the immediate abatement of the hazards above-named. Failure of
the person to whom the permit is issued to abate such hazard(s) in a timely | manner
shall result in Summary Abatement

- Section 1811 B.2 Secunty—Erosnon and Sedimentation Control Performance.

Where eresion and sedimentation control work is required as a part of the approved .
grading plan, the Building Official may require such work to be secured e|ther separately
from, or along with, any grading securlty which may be required.

The Erosion and Sedimentation Control security shall be conditioned on the
performance of the erosion and sedimentation control portion of the approved grading
plan and shall remain in full force and effect during the "Wet Season" or such other time
period which shall be determined by the Building Official.

Section 1811B.3 Seeurity—Term and Completion.

The term of each security shall begin upon the date of the posting thereof and shall end
upon the completion to the satisfaction of the Building Official of all of the terms and
conditions of the permit for the work. Such completion shall be evndenced by a
statement thereof S|gned by the Building Official.






Section 1814B Erosion and Sedimentation Control.

Section 1814B.1 Responsibility for Preventative Measures to Control Erosion and
Sedimentation.

Any person who performs grading, clearing and grubbing or other activities that disturb
the existing soil shall take appropriate preventative measures to control erosion,
sedimentation of eroded materials onto adjacent lands, public streets or rights-of-way,
or carrying of eroded materials to any watercourse by any route. The person in
possession and the owner of the property on which the soil is disturbed are responsible
to perform necessary preventative measures to control erosion and sedimentation.

Section 1814B.2 Preventative Measures to Control Erosion and Sedimentation.

Preventative measures shall be those prescribed in the "Manual of Standards for
Erosion and Sediment Control Measures" of the Association of Bay Area Governments
and as subsequently amended. Preventative measures shall include both interim and
permanent measures to control erosion and sedimentation.

Interim preventative measures shall be taken during the period October 15 to April 15
until permanent control measures are complete and effective. Interim measures shall
include, but not be limited to, waterproof slope covering, drainage ditches around
slopes, short-term control planting, slope benching, riprap, storm drains and energy
dissipation structures.

Permanent preventative measures shall include, but not be limited to, completion of
buildings, walls or other structures, permanent planting, paved ditches, slope benching,
rip-rap storm drains, paving and energy dissipation structures.

The Building Official may require an erosion and sedimentation control plan prior to
issuance of any building permit on lots where the conditions of lot location, configuration
or contour may result in increased problems of erosion or sedimentation control.

Section 1814B.3 Classification of Erosion and Sedimentation Conditions as Constituting
a Hazard. ‘

Any grading, clearing and grubbing or other activities that disturb the existing soil so that
erosion, sedimentation of eroded materials onto adjacent lands, public streets or rights-
of-way or carrying of eroded materials to any watercourse occurs, such activities shall

~ constitute an dangerous condition and shall be abated as set forth in this Chapter.

Section 1815B Discharge of Concentrafed Flow.



Section 1815B.1 General.

Except as established in this Section, it shall be unlawful for anyone to discharge or
channel concentrated flow of storm water onto neighboring property.

‘Section 1815B.2 Methods.

Approved methods of discharge may be achieved in the following ways:

1.

Drain to Streets.

For property located on an improved street which abuts the property
frontage, storm water may drain to the public right-of-way when directed under
the sidewalk in accordance with the Oakland Municipal Code. If the property is

" located on an unimproved street, the property owner shall submit, for approval

by the Building Official, a detail showing how storm water discharges to the
street. The drainage detail shall show the size and type of conduits, the points
where conduit daylights on the slope, and the type and location of slope

- protection.

Dissipation of Storm Water within the Property Boundaries.

The dissipater system shall be designed by a Civil Engineer and shaII not
be closer than fifteen (15) feet from a property line. The system shall be -
approved by the Building Official prior to construction. A Special Inspection
letter shall be submitted to the Building Official and approved prior to issuance
of a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy or a Certificate of Occupancy.

Pumping of Storm Water to a City -Approved Means of Disposal

Storm water may be collected in a catch basm and discharged by a pump to
the street surface.

Discharging Storm Water to a Public Storm Sewer System.

The connection shall be designed by a licensed professional and approved
by the City Engineer or Building Official. A permit issued by the City Engineer
for direct connection to the public storm sewer system shall be required.
Granting of such permit shall be a discretionary action.

115.04.3.2.070 - CBC Section 1905.1.7 deleted.

Delete Section 1905.1.7 of the California Building Code in its entirety.

15.04.3.2.075 - CBC Section 2304.10.5.5 added.

Add the following Section to the California Building Code: |

"Section 2304.10.5.5 Anchor Bolts Anchor bolts are spaced no further than 48

inches in a direction parallel to the sill plate."






In Sectibn R404.1.4.2 of the California Residential Code, delete the last sentence of the
second paragraph starting with "Where Tables R404.1.2(2)...".

15.04.3.25.110 - CRC Section R404.1.5.1 amended.

In Section R404.1.5.1 of the California Residential Code, in the first sentence after
"thickness of the wall supported”, add "or 6 inches, whichever is greater".

15.04.3.25.115 - CRC Section R404.1.5.2 amended.

In Section R404.1.5.2 of the California Residential Code, in the first sentence after
"story above" add "or 6", whichever is greater”.

15.04.3.25.120 - CRC Sections R404.2 and Table R404.2.3 deleted.

Delete Section R404.2 and Table R404.2.3 of the California Residential Code in their
entirety. .

15.04.3.25.125 - CRC Section R405.2 deleted.

Delete Section R405.2 of the California Residential Code in its entirety.

15.04.3.25.13_() - CRC Section R406.3 deleted.

Delete Section R406.3 of the California Residential Code in its entirety.

15.04.3.25.135 - CRC Section R606.4.4 amended.

In Section R606.4.4 of the California Residential Code, delete the first and second
sentence both starting with “Unreinforced” in their entirety.

15.04.3.25.140 - CRC Section R702.3.6 amended.

~ In Section R702.3.6 of the California Residential Code, at the end of the sixth sentence
~starting with "Gypsum board or gypsum panel products shall not be used...", add the
 following to the end of this sentence: ", nor in buildings in Seismic Design Categories

Do, D1, or D2".

15.04.3.25.145 - CRC Appendix K






Insert New Section;

‘AX111 Alternatives and modifications

AX111.1 Alternatives and modifications. Alternative compliance and/or modifications

that are reasonably equivalent to the requirements in this appendix may be granted by,

the enforcing agency in individual cases when dealing with buildings or structures used

for emergency housing.” ' ‘ o
Article i

Part 3 — California Electrical Code
Non-Administrative (Technical) Amendments

15.04.3.3000 - CEC Article 210.11 amended.
In Article 210.11(c)(1) of the California Electrical Code, add the following new sentence.
"Each appliance fastened in place (fixed) including but not limited to

dishwashers, garbage disposals, trash compactors, and microwave ovens, shall be
supplied by a separate branch circuit rated for the appliance or load served."

15.04.3.3005 - CEC Art_icle 210.12 amended.

In Article 210.12(A) of the California Electrical Code, add the following new sentence:
"Circuits in dwelling unit family rooms, dihing rooms, living rooms, parlors,

libraries, dens, bedrooms, kitchens , laundry areas, sunrooms, recreation rooms,
closets, hallways or similar rooms or areas shall have arc-fault protection as follows:

1) | In any new or upg_raded service panel or subpanel.”
And in Section 210.12 (B) delete the exemption at the end of (B)(2) in its entirety. |
15.04.3.3010 - CEC Article 230.1 amended.
In Article 230.1 of the California Electrical Code, delete the words in the first paragraph:
"Building or structure" |
‘And replace witH:
"Pércel, unless approved by vthe building official."

And add section (F):



"(F) Additional service (s) may be allowed for the purpose of supplyrng EV
charging equipment.”

15.04.3.3015 - CEC Article 230.26 amended.

In Article 230.26 of the California Electrical Code, add the following new paragraph:

"The service point of attachment shall be installed on the building or structure
wall facrng the serving line. The service point of attachment on a periscope-type
service shall be installed within erghteen (18) inches of the building or structure wall
facing the serving line."

15.04.3.3020 - CEC Article 230.28 amended.

In Article 230.28 of the California Electrical Code, add the following new paragraph:

"Conduit for service conductors shall be rigid metal conduit or intermediate
metal conduit not less than on and one-quarter (1.25) inch trade size. Aluminum
rigid metal condurt shall be not smaller than two (2) inches trade size where used as
a periscope."

15.04.3.3025 - CEC Article 230.29 amended

In Article 230.29 of the California Electrical Code, add the following new paragraph:

"Service conduit above a building or structure roof shall not extend more than
thirty (30) inches beyond the last support without bracing. The outer or upper-end of
overhead service conduit shall extend horizontally not more than eighteen (18)

. inches beyond the point of support or fastening. Service conduit coupled above a
- structure or past the edge of same shall be braced or supported between the
coupling and the point of attachment."

15.04.3.3030 - CEC Article 230.43.

In Article 230.43 of the California Electrical Code, replace the sectlon in its entirety wrth '
the following: :

"Service entrance conductors shall be installed in approved rigid metal conduit
or intermediate metal conduit on the outside of buildings or structures. Rigid non-
metallic conduit (schedule 80) shall be permitted to be installed for service lateral
conductors outside the building. Rigid non-metallic conduit (schedule 40) shall be
permitted to be installed for service lateral conductors where not exposed to
physical damage outside the building. '

Termination cans or any equrpment for service lateral conductors shall not
encroach into the public way."

15.04.3.3035 - Reserved.






N "2 " 2 ! @" 2

A F +( F 7
*N
&8*(;*9*9(:8 B D:(*& 2 *
D:(*& 1 L
N F 7 # # % 2 " 2
@" 2 F 7 22
A " " A "
*N

&8*(*9*9(D( B $ *

2-(+ 15

2- #=.5)23,, +9.3,(/ )4+
)3=47,3,0-2.-,6+  +(93,(/  7+347+3-0

&8*(,*9*,((( B < 1 = *
B < N7 " F o 7 = @2
B < N $ ) N
B < = 4<2 " " N
&8*(,;*9*,(&( B 8(*9*+*& 2 *
8(,*9*+*& 1 | #
4
N % | ") " <" % 21
A ) @ ! )
*N
&8*(,;*o*,(+( B &9(*8*"*& 2 *
&9(*8**& 1
N %) 2 < < 22 %
»o# " ! ) &9&+*:* "
"# 2 %! # # % 2

%

4
2

# B
2% )



Article il

Part 5 — California Plumbing Code
Non-Administrative (Technical) Amendments

15.04.3.5000 - CPC Section 604.1.2, Subsection ("5") added.

"(5) PEX shall only be used in installed in conjunction or contact with chemically
compatible products. Upon request from the Building Official the installer shall furnish
independent testing reports to demonstrate compliance with this requirement. PEX shall
be protected from exposure to chemical agents that will either degrade the material or
infiltrate into the potable water supply."

15.04.3.5010 - Section 701.1.2 of the California Plumbing Code amended.

In section 701.1 Subsection (6) add the following at the end of the section.

"Cast Iron Soil Pipe and fittings must conform to ASTM 888. Cast Iron Soil Pipe
shall bear the UPC, ASTM 888 and NSF markings and comply with annex A of the
- CISPI 301 Standard. No Hub fittings shall be marked with the UPC and NSF
markings and comply with the CISPI 301 standard, including Annex A of the
Standard. All 601b couplings shall be shielded and bear the UPC, NSF Markings
and comply with the CISPI 310 Standard."

15.04.3.5015 - CPC Section 713.2 deleted and replaced.

CPC Sectlon 713.2 deleted and replaced with the foIIowmg

"Section 713.2.1 Performance, maintenance, repair, or abandonment of an
existing private sewage disposal system shall conform with the requirements of the
Alameda County Department of Environmental Health.

~ Section 713.2.2 Installation, replacement, repair, maintenance, or modification
of a water supply system and piping, in-ground pools, or other infrastructure with
respect to an existing private sewage disposal system shall conform with the
requirements of the Alameda County Health Department.

Sec. 713.2.3 New or additional connections of a building sewer, waste pipe, or
soil pipe to a proposed or existing private sewage disposal system shall be
prohibited.

Sec. 713.2.4 Proposed increases of the quantity or quality of sewage and liquid
waste which may or will exceed the existing designed capacity of a private sewage
disposal system shall be prohibited.

~ Sec. 713.2.5 Modification or replacement of an eX|st|ng private sewage dlsposal
system for the purpose of increasing the existing capacity is prohibited."




- 15.04.3.5025 - CPC Sections 1014.1.3, 1014.2.1, 1014.3.4, 1016.2 amended.

In Section 1014.1.3 of the California Plumbing Code, add the foilowing sentence at
the end of the section:

"Commercial garbage or food waste grinders shall not be installed in produce
markets, food markets or similar establishments".

In Section 1014.2.1, at the end of first paragraph, add the following sentence:

"Where the Building Official approves the use of a hydro-mechanical grease
interceptor, it shall be sized to a one minute drainage period using the formula
found in table 1014.2.1."

In Section 1014.3.4, add the following new paragraph at the end of the section:

"A properly sized Gravity Interceptor shall be installed where space on site will
accommodate the device. When installed in a Parking area, HS 20 rings and covers
shall be provided. Where the grease line exceeds twenty five feet prior to entering
the Interceptor, Pretreatment shall be provided."

In Section 1016.2, add the following new paragraph at the end of the section:

"Sand/Qil Interceptors shall be installed at required trash enclosures. The
enclosure shall be equipped with a method to wash down the enclosure and the
enclosure shall be designed to prevent run-off and run-on to ensure protection of
the Storm and Sanitary sewers". -

15.04.3.5030 - CPC Section 1208.5.8.1 amended.

In Section 1208.5.8.1 of the California Plumbing Code, add after the first sentence:

~ "Unions shall only be permitted in exposed exterior locations immediately
downstream of the building shutoff and as otherwise acceptable in section 1212.5.
The use of right-left Nipples and couplings are permltted anywhere in the gas piping
system and may be concealed after testing".

15.04.3.5035 - CPC Section 1213.3 amended.
In Section 1213.3 of the California Plumbing Code, add the following in the third

sentence between welded piping and for piping carrying gas, "piping two inches and
- larger".

15.04.3.5040 - CPC Appendix A adopted.

Adopt Appéndix A of the California Plumbing Code in its entirety.
15.04.3.5045 - CPC Appendix B adopted.

Adopt Appendix B of the California Plumbing Code in its entirety.
15.04.3.5050 - CPC Appendix D adopted.

Adopt Appendix D of the California Plumbing Code in its entirety.






&8*(,*9*8&&+(B = FE* AR Y F&(FFAF 2 %
C&(* = "# 1
") # "2) ’*&(:*’*4_*91 ,*&(:*,*+*’1 ,*&(:*,*+*8 ,*&(:*8*'*'*:
% ! | #4
# # | U (,2(1,-
@N " " ) ! (B2 +('Q+,(BM
" # %1 %1 $ $ 1 !
2 ! 2 *
) <2 % M # * 0
# M A# @" 1 1%
-2 &B 2 0O
# # #  3.((+00,@/+ 2.(+D.8
" "2 I # 2 1% 2
1% 2 " M
# o | % 2 )
- S 1 )
2 # "o
# # " [+(-2,(./  .3+/ .*.(,-8
) ! % " (B2
+('Q+,(BM " A# K&+ "
7 %N* " "2 $ %
$ % % 21 " # % B )"
2 -01 $ " % 2" "% # M
@N M (B2 *
-+ 7 % " " 2 # "
! % " " " "
% # @" 2 * @" 2 ) #
2 # @" % "2) M
(B2 $ =
# # 4+3-5,(.-)3
$ ") " % % $ "
$ $ -0 $ "M ## NM N
" ! NM 7 PN* 1% 2
2 % $)Y%2 A NM N neooo !
7 P N*
4
2 ")
N " 2 $ -
$ "2
* G 2 M # 7%$2 A#

%



in the New Policies. & Directives Number 13-01. Website:
http://mww.dot.ca.gov/trafficops/policy/13-01.pdf.

2. See Vehicle Code Section 22511 for EV charging space signage in off-street
parking facilities and for use of EV charging spaces.

3. The Governor's Office of Planning and Research (OPR) published a "Zero-
Emission Vehicle Community Readiness Guidebook" which provides helpful
information for local government, residents and businesses. Website:

 https://www.opr.ca.gov/docs/ZEV Guidebook.pdf.

15.04.3.11125 - CGBSC Section 4.106.4.2.7 added.

In Section 4.106.4.2 of the California Green Building Sténdards Code, add new
subsection 4.106.4.2.7:

4.106.4.2.7 Chapter 11B Accessible EVCS requirements.

Construction documents shall indicate how many accessible EVCS would be
required under Title 24 Chapter 11B Table 11B-228.3.2.1, if applicable, in order to
convert all EV capable and EV ready spaces required under 4.106 to EVCS.
Construction documents shall also demonstrate that the facility is designed so that

- compliance with accessibility standards including 11B-812.5 accessible routes will
be feasible for the required accessible EVCS at the time of EVCS installation.
Surface slope for any area designated for accessible EVCS shall meet slope
requirements in section 11B-812.3 at the time of original building construction and
vertical clearance requirements in Section 11B-812-4.

Note: Section 11B-812 of the 2016 California Building Code requires that a
facility providing EVCS for public and common use also provide one or more
accessible EVCS as specified in Table 11B-228.3.2.1. Chapter 11B applies to
certain facilities including but not limited to public accommodations and publicly

“funded housing (see section 1.9 of Part 2 of the California Building Code). Section
11B-812.4 requires that "Parking spaces, access aisles and vehicular routes
~serving them shall provide a vertical clearance of 98 inches (2489 mm) minimum."
~ Section 11B-812.3 requires that parking spaces and access aisles meet maximum
slope requirements of 1 unit vertical in 48 units horizontal (2.083 percent slope) in
any direction at the time of new building construction or renovation. Section 11B-
~ 812.5 contains accessible route requirements. Section 4.106.4.2.7 requires that
developers meet certain aspects of accessnblllty requirements at the time of new
construction.

15.04.3.11130 - CGBSC Sections 5.106.5.3—5.106.5.3.4 amended.

In Section 5.106.5.3 of the California Green Building Standards Code, delete
subparagraphs 5.106.5.3, 5.106.5.3.1, 5.106.5.3.2, 5.106.5.3.3 and 5.106.5.3.4 in their
entirety and replace with the following:

209


http://www.dot.ca.gOv/trafficops/policy/13-01
https://www.opr.ca.gov/docs/ZEV

SECTION 5.106.5.3
SITE DEVELOPMENT

5.106.5.3 Electric vehicle (EV) charging. Construction shall include EV
charging electric infrastructure as specified in this Section to facilitate future
installation of EVSE. All EV charging electric infrastructure and EVSE (when
installed) shall be in accordance with the California Electrical Code.

Greater than 20
parking spaces

Full Circuit

Inaccessible Raceway
Installed

Electric Panel
Capacity

i 10 percent of

parking spaces
(rounded up)

10 percent of parking
spaces (rounded up)

Sufficient to supply 20
percent of parking
spaces

parking spaces

spaces

spaces

space

16—26 or more

2 parking spaces

2 parking spaces

Sufficient to supply 4
parking spaces

11—15 parking |
T S

1parkmg e

2 parking spaces

1 parking spaces

- Sufficient to supply 3

parking spaces

2 parking spaces

‘Sufficient to supply 2

parking spaces

1 parking space

Sufficient to supply 1
parking space

Exceptions: On a case-by-case basis where the local enforcing agehcy has

determined EV charging and infrastructure is not feasible based upon one or more of
the following conditions:

1. Where there is insufficient electrical supply.

- 2. Where there is evidence substantiating that meeting the requirements will alter
the local utility infrastructure design requirements on the utility side of the meter
so as to increase the utility side cost to the developer by more than $400.00 per
parking space. In such cases, buildings subject to Section 5.106.5.3 shall
maximize the quantity of EV infrastructure, without exceeding the limit above.

Cost shall be determined by dividing total cost by total number of EV and non-EV
parking spaces.

5.106.5.3.1 Full circuit.

Required full circuits shall be installed wnth 40-Amp 208/240-Volt capacity
including raceway, electrical panel capacity, overprotection devices, wire and

100







$ @" 2 &8 B'&+* *
)+ &8 B'&+ +(&: " @"
% $ # M " 22 " $ 2
) M ) && BHHFOrHREH &&
") 2 ") 22 " %
" " - &6 7 + " O
8& B'&+, @" N7 A# 1 $ " "
$# 2 $ $ 6 46 220 2 2"2*N
&8 B'&+9 @" A # 2 2<2%
@" 2 ¢ S | (‘9 0
% 2 Loy # " $ &8 B
'8+*8 ) @ 2 8*&(*8*9*8 @"
$ 2 ) % @ @" 2 2 !
" =% (@,/-8
)30-21(-)3 .34 +6+2.@,/,-8
" % 1 1 1 M 1 1 "1
) ) $ | # )
$ $ % 2 # l 2 "
* " % A )% X $
$ 1 1 1 " 1
1 "1 $ % 2
1 1 1 " 1 1 "1 )
55+(-,6+ .34 *+2.-6+ .-+0
) 2 $ )% " 2 $
$ " % A 1 $ %
A 1 +&: A )
L# > " 0% L+
)35)27,3:  9.3:40
% " % " % 2 # 2 A
No$1 2 # # - % % #

@" 2 && B'&+*9 2 # ) # "

01 2 " 2 2 A "



)
)% %
" #1 |

> "% &L+(+(1" "

P1 SP 1 PF 1

7 . FPPO= M4
BF 1 =PP1 =
7 S7P -0?
B
g
B
341(-)3 -+

n # %
# 2 2
1 # | %
"# 22
$ I
1 SP1 1 P1
P
% A A !
Al
4

%

+(&6



&(,



